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Syrian ‘Regime Change’ Architect: William Roebuck,
US Ambassador of Destruction
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Since 2006, William Roebuck, a US Diplomat, has been working toward ‘regime change’ in
Syria at any cost. The destruction of Syria, hundreds of thousands of deaths and injuries,
and the migration of one-third of the population have been the price of the US policy under
Roebuck’s tenure.  The ultimate goal of ‘regime change’ has never been about greater
freedoms, democracy, or human rights for Syrians, but has been with the single target
spelled out by Roebuck in 2006: to break the relationship between Iran and Syria. 

William Roebuck, US Ambassador ‘to the Kurds in Syria’

William Roebuck is a 27 year veteran of the US State Department, having served under
Presidents Bush, Obama, and currently Trump.  His current title is Deputy Special Envoy to
the Global Coalition to Defeat ISIS. He is a former US Ambassador to Syria and Bahrain.  He
has  served  in  the  US  embassies  in  Iraq  and  chargé  d’affaires  in  Libya  under  Obama.
Seymour M. Hersh wrote about the US Embassy in Libya and its role in arming the terrorists
used by the US in Syria.  For the past several years, he has been based in Northeast Syria
and managing the Kurds.

Roebuck designed the 2011 “Arab Spring” in Syria

WikiLeaks founder Julian Assange revealed a plan concocted by William Roebuck, the former
US Ambassador to Syria.  Wikileaks published US diplomatic cables, and chapter 10 of “The
Wikileaks  Files”  concerns  Roebuck’s  cable  sent  on  December  13,  2006.   Ambassador
Roebuck wrote that the US should take action to try to destabilize the Syrian government by
provoking it to overreact, both internally and externally. That plan was put into action in
March 2011 at Deraa, where armed terrorists were interspersed among unarmed civilians in
street protests. The terrorists were provoking the police and security forces by shooting at
them, as well as shooting unarmed civilians which were blamed on the security forces.

The cables prove that ‘regime change’ had been the goal of US policy in Syria since 2006
and that the US promoted sectarianism in support of its policy, which built the foundation for
the  sectarian  conflict  which  resulted  in  massive  bloodshed.  Roebuck  advocated  for
exploiting Syria’s relationship with Iran, which makes Syria vulnerable to Israeli airstrikes.
Roebuck  advised  that  the  US  should  destabilize  the  Syrian  government  by  promoting
sectarian divisions between Sunni and Shia, which at the time was not an issue in Syria,
which is a secular government and a tolerant society. By promoting sectarian conflict, which
he had observed in the oil-rich Arab Gulf monarchies, Roebuck was crafting the destruction
of Syrian society.  The ultimate US goal in Syria was to destabilize the Syrian government by
violent means, resulting in a change of government, and the new government would be pro-
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Israeli, and anti-Iranian.

Roebuck’s memo leaked

In November 2019 an internal memo written on October 31 by Roebuck was leaked to the
press. He criticized Trump for failing to stop Turkey from invading the Northeast of Syria.
“Turkey’s military operation in northern Syria, spearheaded by armed Islamist groups on its
payroll,  represents  an  intentioned-laced  effort  at  ethnic  cleansing,”  Mr.  Roebuck  wrote,
calling  the  abuses  “what  can  only  be  described  as  war  crimes  and  ethnic  cleansing.”

Roebuck praised the SDF as a reliable partner acting as guards to keep US troops safe while
they occupied Syria illegally, to steal the Syrian oil, which is to be used to support the SDF,
instead of the Pentagon payroll.

Two is the company, but three is a crowd

The US state department has a Syrian trio: William Roebuck, and the special representative
for Syria engagement, James Jeffrey. Joel Rayburn is a deputy assistant secretary for Levant
Affairs and special envoy for Syria.

Iraqi and Syrian Kurdish officials are often confused as to which US officials are in charge on
any given issue, and whether their  policies were personally driven, or reflected US foreign
policy directives. Many analysts agree that the US foreign policy on Syria is a confusing
mess.

Roebuck pushes the Syrian Kurds to unite

The Kurdish National Council (KNC) and the Kurdish Democratic Union Party (PYD) have
begun direct talks which US diplomat William Roebuck has promoted. For the last two years,
he has been working with the Syrian Kurds.  The goal is to unite all Kurdish parties in Syria
in one body, which could be part of the UN peace talks in Geneva to end the Syrian conflict. 
The KNC and PYD have had serious disagreements over the years.

The KNC is part of  the Istanbul-based ‘Syrian opposition’ and aligned with the Kurdish
nationalist Massoud Barzani and his Kurdistan Democratic Party (KDP) in Iraq.  The KNC
received criticism as being pro-Turkish after the Turkish Army invaded the Northeastern
region of Syria.

The PYD is part of the political arm of the Syrian Democratic Forces (SDF) who had been the
US  partner  fighting  ISIS.   PYD  bases  its  political  and  organizational  projects  on  the  PKK’s
ideology. The PKK is considered as an international terrorist group accused of thousands of
deaths in Turkey over the decades.

The first direct negotiations between the KNC and PYD were held in early April at an illegal
US military base near Hasakah, with William Roebuck, an SDF commander Mazlum Abdi in
attendance.  Roebuck has met numerous times over the past three months with the KNC,
trying to push the idea of unification among the Kurdish factions.

At an April 25 press conference in Qamishli, it was announced that Roebuck had presented a
draft  that  called for  a unified political  vision for  Syria.   After  about four  meetings,  the two
sides were in agreement on the following points: Syria is to be a federal, democratic, and
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pluralistic  state;  the  current  Syrian  government  in  Damascus  was  not  acceptable;  the
Kurdish northeast region was to be a political unit.  It was stressed that both parties were
committed to resolving the Syrian crisis through the implementation of UN Resolution 2254,
and the new Syrian constitution must recognize Kurdish national,  cultural,  and political
rights.

The SDF and PYD do not have political representation in the Geneva talks because of Turkish
opposition to their participation, given the fact that Turkey views the groups as terrorists. 
Turkey rejects any project that would lead to Kurdish autonomous rule in Syria, which is the
goal of the US. When Trump ordered the sudden withdrawal of US troops from the Northeast
of Syria in October, the Kurdish leaders immediately turned to the Syrian government in
Damascus to save them from extermination at the hands of the invading Turkish Army. 
However, the US did not want the Kurds to be protected by Damascus. The US goal is
‘regime change’  using UN Resolution 2254 as their  tool.  To achieve that  end,  William
Roebuck has continued to work with the Kurds of the Northeast and is now trying to get
them united to be at the negotiating table in Geneva. The Kurds might unite, but they will
always  remain  a  small  minority  numbering  only  7%  of  the  population,  but  who  are
attempting to control 20% of the territory in Syria.  Will there be justice for the Syrian
homeowners and landowners within the territory the Kurds call “Rojava”, who have been
made homeless and destitute at the hands of the Kurds? Will the Syrians one day rise in a
“Kurdish Spring” cleaning to regain their properties?

Ahed al-Hindi, a political analyst based in Washington, DC, told  Al-Monitor that the US goal
to unify the Kurdish ranks in northeastern Syria is a part of a project designed to unify the
entire Syrian north, including Idlib and the Kurdish Northeast.  The US goal is to prevent the
Syrian government from access to the resources which could be used to rebuild Syria.

The next UN peace talks in Geneva

UN Special  Envoy Geir O. Pedersen gave a UN Security Council  briefing on the situation in
Syria on April  29. He announced the agenda for the next session of the Constitutional
Committee had been agreed between the co-chairs, and meetings in Geneva would resume
as soon as the COVID-19 restrictions would allow. He continued to stress the importance of
the  current  nationwide  ceasefire,  which  was  needed  to  combat  and  treat  COVID-19.   He
declared  there  is  no  military  solution  to  the  Syrian  conflict,  and  the  UN  Security  Council
resolution 2254 must be used as the path to a political settlement that would be acceptable
for the Syrian people while restoring the sovereignty, borders, and independence of Syria.

*
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