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Never  before  has  a  prime minister  of  the Zionist  entity  appeared so  confused as  did
Benjamin Netanyahu  in his meeting with President Vladimir Putin.  Netanyahu was
looking through a set of papers he was holding, as if he’s hoping to find a way out. This is
the  first  time  he  relied  on  what  was  written  in  his  notes  in  such  an  important  summit
meeting.

The viewer did not need to hear what he was saying, because Putin’s stern expressions
expressed his suspicion of the repeated Israeli usual dull hyperbolic claims about the Iranian
threat, and the Russian President refused Netanyahu’s aggressive schemes. In Pravda’s
report  on  25  August  2017,  entitled  “Netanyahu’s  nightmare  becomes  a  reality,”  the
newspaper reveals that Putin answered Netanyahu saying:

“Iran is a strategic ally of Russia in the Middle East.” And when the latter
exaggerated  in  describing  the  Iranian  threat,  President  Putin  responded:
“Unfortunately, I cannot help you here.”

Pravda  reports  that  Netanyahu  failed  to  convince  Putin  of  the  by-now-boring  Israeli
argument  about  “Iranian  expansion  in  the  Middle  East.”  Commenting  on  the  Putin-
Netanyahu summit, the Israeli newspaper Maariv said in its reports on 23 August 2017:
“Israel has become isolated on the international scene.” It’s only friend now is the ruling
Wahhabi  families  in  the  Gulf,  whose  media,  representatives  and  hired  mercenaries
mindlessly repeat Netanyahu’s claims.

But what is behind this Israeli hysteria and the visits by its official to the US and Russia in
order to promote these “threats” to Israeli’s security? And what has happened recently that
provoked such a reaction from the Zionist entity’s leaders? Does Netanyahu and the ruling
clique in Tel Aviv really think that world powers are as stupid and naive as the rulers of Gulf
Sheikhdoms?

The main event the provoked these reactions is the change that occurred in the regional
balance of power after the Syrian and Iraqi armies and the forces of resistance advanced in
several areas, liberating Mosul and reaching an agreement in southern Syria, that gave
neither Jordan nor Israel a role in monitoring the deescalation zone.

Both the announced and the unannounced coordination and cooperation between Iraq,
Syria, and Lebanon, with the presence of Russia and Iran, in commanding this wide front
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from Iran to the Mediterranean have cost the Zionist entity its decade-long hegemony,
which recently expanded to include the Saudi Kingdom and the Gulf States.

The Resistance has proven that breaking the backbone of this Israeli propaganda is not
impossible, and that the enemy now needs to recalculate its position according to new
realities on the battlefield,  and on the regional  and international  levels.  Another factor,  no
less important than the regional one, is the victory achieved by the forces of resistance and
the Arab Army in Syria and Iraq, and in the Qalamoun region, and the rapid collapse of the
terrorist groups across the board.

The capture of the strategic Qalamoun mountains, which connects Syria to Lebanon, has
eliminated Israel’s terrorist mercenaries from that vital region, to the dismay of Israel’s
rulers who reacted in a hysterical manner in front of the whole world. This victory has
proven that Israel cannot hold an inch of our land through its terrorist mercenaries.

Also, the forces of resistance and the Arab Army in Syria and Iraq proved that they have
reached unprecedented levels of military capabilities, a fact that frightens the Zionist enemy
and leads it to alter its plans in any coming battle. The Zionist entity is not only concerned
that its terrorist gangs are losing ground, but also it is worried about the future battle
against those who seek to liberate the land from its despicable occupation.

No matter how much the Zionists train their army, it remains a theoretical training, as
opposed  to  the  filed  experience  of  the  battle-hardened  forces  of  resistance  and  the  Arab
armies in Syria and Iraq. Also, the coordination between Iran, Iraq, Syria, and Lebanon is a
nightmare that the Zionist enemy fears because its power is built on dividing the Arabs,
because the Zionists know that when the Arab unite their strategies, plans, and actions, the
Zionist entity would collapse as rapidly as its terrorist mercenaries.

Another important factor that concerns the Zionists is that their historic and strategic ally
the United States is drowning in internal disputes, and has been losing its credibility as a
Great Power both on the internal and international scenes, despite its looting of Saudi and
Gulf wealth. So when their main partner couldn’t deliver assurances, the Zionists turned to
Russia hoping to sway its decision makers, using the usual lies about their entity being
under threat.

But  in  Russia,  the Zionists  were met  by a  strong leader  who respects  his  words  and
commitments, and does not compromise his country’s fundamental principles. The Zionists
realise that the Russian leader has the final word today in all issues in the Middle East, and
the word of the United States, the West, and their Wahhabi mercenaries no longer counts.

It is a fact of life today that terrorism that hit Syria, Iraq, Libya, Yemen, destroying their
civilisational heritage and killing millions of their citizens is a Zionist terrorism funded by the
Saudi royals. Former MI6 chief Richard Dearlove admitted in a lecture in London that Saudi
Arabia helped ISIS (Daesh) in capturing Mosul  and the whole of  northern Iraq,  and by
association eastern Syria, and that the coming days will reveal Saudi Arabia to be a tool in
the hands of the Zionists, and that both Saudi Arabia and Qatar paid billions of dollars to
destroy Arab countries.

Today, we are in a time in which Zionist tools are collapsing in Syria and Iraq, and the
leaders of the Zionist entity are trembling because the unjust war they waged alongside
their Saudi mercenaries against our people has only made our armies and our resistance
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stronger and more competent. So what can our enemies do?

May God have mercy on the souls of our martyred young men who gave their lives for this
Nation, and we pray for the wounded, for all of them have given their blood to serve this
noble cause, the cause of all Arabs and Muslims, the cause of Palestine and the occupied
land, and the rights of our peoples to live freely on their land.

The hysteria that befell the Zionist entity and its poorly calculated actions will only help
further reveal its true role and the role of its operatives in the systematic destruction of
Syria, Lebanon, Iraq, Libya, and Yemen. And history will also reveal the truth behind the
events we experienced in the past few years. Netanyahu’s visit to Putin and his trembling
body language is only the first sign, and there will be many more to come.

This article was originally published by 21st Century Wire.
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