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De-Banking Political Opponents: After Leftist Lobbying, German Bank Kills “Anti-
Globalist Opposition AfD Donation Account

By Ben Bartee, July 08, 2024

Canada yesterday; Germany today; the whole of the West tomorrow. It’s only a matter of
time until  de-banking political  opponents becomes standard operating procedure in the
United States — bastion of Democracy™ that it is.

Fluoridation  and “Forever  Chemicals”  (PFAS):  Federal  Hypocrisy  Is  Poisoning
Americans with Toxic Synthetic Chemicals

By Richard Gale and Dr. Gary Null, July 08, 2024

A process we were led to believe was a safe and effective method of protecting teeth from
decay is in fact a fraud. For decades it’s been shown that fluoridation is neither essential for
good health nor protective of teeth. What it does is poison the body.

The End of Obama’s War on Syria

By Steven Sahiounie, July 08, 2024

Recently,  Turkey  has  changed  their  policy  on  Syria  in  an  effort  to  restore  diplomatic
relations with Damascus. The Prime Minister of Iraq, al-Sudani, announced he expects a
meeting between the Turkish President Recip Tayyip Erdogan and Syrian President Bashar
al-Assad very soon.
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Western-Supported Zionist Genocide and the Pathology of Evil

By Mark Taliano, July 08, 2024

Novelist Susan Abulhawa explains that the declared Palestinian death toll (of about 37,000)
itself  is a deception first because of the manner in which the numbers are calculated, and
second, because of the reduced capacity to count death tolls.

The Multipolar World Is Getting Stronger?

By Ret Admiral Cem Gürdeniz, July 08, 2024

Geopolitical rivalries cannot be overcome without mutual trust and cooperation between
countries. In geopolitical competition, mutual recognition of areas of influence and interest
is essential, as was the case during the Cold War. The USA recognized the Soviet sphere of
influence in 1945 and agreed to live in a bipolar world until 1989.

Massacre at the Ballot: The Punishing of the Tories

By Dr. Binoy Kampmark, July 08, 2024

A whole brigade of senior Conservatives suffered a rout.  Commons leader Penny Mordaunt
lost her seat, as did defence secretary Grant Shapps.  That manorial relic of Tory tradition
and privilege, Sir Jacob Rees-Mogg, was also ousted from his seat.  The Liberal Democrats
made huge inroads into traditional Conservative territory, winning seats held by two former
prime ministers – David Cameron and Theresa May.

Lawsuit  on Behalf  of  Vaccine-injured Seeks to Strike Down ‘Unconstitutional’
PREP Act

By Dr. Suzanne Burdick, July 08, 2024

Moms  for  America  and  individual  plaintiffs  who  were  injured  by  a  COVID-19  vaccine,  or
whose loved one suffered injury or  death from a COVID-19 vaccine,  allege the federal  law
granting vaccine makers immunity for injuries caused by their products violates the U.S.
Constitution.
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