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As battles in Syria rage, there appears to be talk of breaking the country into pieces as a
way to end conflict. But the question arises over whose interests would be served by cutting
up the Arab nation?

“The partitioning of Syria is the Israeli solution—their overarching goal is to weaken every
Arab state by bringing religion and ethnicity into the equation,” James Paul,  executive
director of Global Policy Forum, told The Final Call. “We do not want to live in a world like
that,” he said.

Discussions concerning the possible partitioning of Syria became a hot-button issue in the
corridors of the UN after a blogger reported that an unnamed diplomat revealed the plan to
partition Syria into three new states—Alawite, Sunni and Kurdish.

Dr. Stephen Zunes, professor of politics and international studies at the University of San
Francisco, explained why he disagrees with those who say Syria may be partitioned: “The
religious and ethnic divisions in Syria are not so tightly geographically demarcated as to
make any kind of partition realistically possible.”

But, Stratfor.com, a provider of geopolitical analysis tended to agree with Mr. Paul saying
Syria “could collapse into a Lebanon situation in which it disintegrates into regions held by
various factions with no effective central government.”

“Regime  change  and  balkanization  in  Syria  is  very  closely  tied  to  the  objective  of
dismantling the ‘resistance bloc’ formed by Iran, Syria, Hezbollah, the Palestinians, and
various Iraqi groups opposed to the U.S. and Israel,” said Mahdi Darius Nazemroaya, a
Canadian-based  sociologist,  scholar  and  research  associate  at  the  Center  for  Global
Research. 

Mr. Nazemroaya continued: “The road to Tehran is being paved through Damascus and the
Syrian government was constantly warned for several years to de-link itself from its Iranian
ally and the Arab resistance groups.” Israel and the White House want to see the region in
sectarian upheaval where the Arabs are killing one another, he added.

Some observers say more and more the U.S. role in destabilizing the Syrian regime becomes
clear, as media headlines Aug. 2 reported a “secret order” signed by President Obama
authorizing  the  Central  Intelligence  Agency  and other  U.S.  agencies  to  support  rebels
fighting to depose Syrian President Bashar al-Assad. News reports also said there is no way
of knowing when the president signed the order.
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The New York Times on June 21 revealed that the CIA was operating secretly in Southern
Turkey helping with the arming of Syrian opposition fighters.

The White House had declined to comment at Final Call press time.

On Aug. 1,  a spokesman for  the U.S.  State Dept.  informed the press that the Obama
administration had a $25 million budget for “nonlethal assistance” to the Syrian opposition,
and had spent approximately $10 million so far. The White House announced Aug. 2 it was
providing an additional $12 million in U.S. humanitarian assistance and another $76 million
in assistance for food, water, medical supplies, clothing and hygiene kits.

The  UN  refugee  agency  said  thousands  of  frightened  residents  fleeing  the  violence  in
Aleppo, Syria’s largest city, are seeking shelter in schools, mosques and public buildings.
The Syrian Arab Red Cross said they are registering about 300 displaced families a day.

Well  over  70,000 people have sought formal  protection in  Turkey,  while  the Jordanian
government estimates some 150,000 Syrian refugees have entered since March of 2011. In
Lebanon, 34,096 where displaced Syrians are receiving protection and assistance, according
to the UN.

“This balkanization process is very dangerous, because it essentially means segregating
people. It is the ‘clash of civilizations’ that the neo-cons and their Likud cousins in Israel
want,” said Mr. Nazemroaya.

The  Christians  of  Syria  like  their  brethren  in  Iraq  are  being  forced  to  flee  their  ancestral
homes, he said.

Bill Fletcher, executive editor of Black Commentator, doesn’t buy into the theory of the West
deliberately re-drawing the maps of Arab nations. “When you look at Syria it is much like
Libya, a legitimate rising up of people against tyranny,” Mr. Fletcher argued. Forces in the
West do not see Syria as a possible threat to Israel, but Syria’s relationship with Iran is seen
as the threat, he said.

“I  want to emphasize that we are not only dealing with a strategy to only divide and
destabilize the Arab countries.  This  is  a  strategy that  targets  Africa,  Iran,  Russia,  and
Russia’s former Soviet sister-republics, Pakistan and China,” argued Mr. Nazemroaya.
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